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Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
 
Request/Response: 
 

1. The total number of patients treated for migraine in your area 
 
NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. 

 
2. Botox treatments: 

a. if available, the total number of migraine patients receiving Botox treatments  
b. if available, average number of days waiting time for patients from referral to 

administering Botox treatment  
c. whether the administration of Botox treatments is monitored by a  headache 

            specialist (yes/no) 
 
NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information.  You may wish to redirect your 
request to the individual treatment centres. 

 
3. Individual funding requests (structure): 

a. job title of staff member and/or title of team responsible for responding to IFR 
         applications 
 
Individual Exceptional Funding Request Team 

 
4. Individual funding requests for migraine treatment (totals): 

a. total number of IFR applications made for migraine treatment 
b. total number of IFR applications made for migraine treatment which have been 

approved (i.e. funding for treatment granted) 
c. total number of IFR applications made for migraine treatment which have been  

            rejected (i.e. funding for treatment not granted) 
 
Please see the attached spreadsheet. Please note that NHS South Sefton CCG came into 
existence on 1 April 2013 and therefore does not hold the figures for 2012 – 2013 

 
5. Individual funding requests for migraine treatment (devices and treatment) 

Our ref: FOI ID 4598 
 
 
February 2015 
 
Address southseftonccg.foi@nhs.net 
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a. Spring TMS device: total number of approved applications 
b. Spring TMS device: total number of rejected applications 
c. Gammacore nVNS device: total number of approved applications 
d. Gammacore nVNS device: total number of rejected applications 
e. Cefaly device: total number of approved applications 
f. Cefaly device: total number of rejected applications 
g.  Any other device or treatment not including those above: total number of approved 

applications 

h. Any other device or treatment not including those above: total number of rejected  

            applications 

 

Please see the attached spreadsheet. Please note that NHS South Sefton CCG came into 

existence on 1 April 2013 and therefore does not hold the figures for 2012 – 2013. 

 

 


