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Re: Freedom of Information Request
Request/Response:

Under the Freedom of Information Act, please provide figures for your CCG(s), for (i) 2011/12, (ii)
2012/13 and (iii) 2013/14:

1. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus (Specify time period)
a. Of those diagnosed with Barrett’'s oesophagus, the number with high grade
dysplasia
b. Of those diagnosed with Barrett’'s oesophagus, the number with low grade
dysplasia

2. No. of patients under surveillance with Barrett's oesophagus
a. Of those under surveillance, the number with high grade dysplasia
b. Of those under surveillance, the number with low grade dysplasia

3. No. of patients diagnosed with oesophageal adenocarcinoma

4. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had an endoscopic mucosal
resection (EMR)

a. Of those who had EMR, the number for low grade dysplasia

b. Of those who had EMR, the number for high grade dysplasia

c. Of those who had EMR, the number for intramucosal cancer

5. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had radiofrequency ablation
(RFA) without EMR

a. Of those who had RFA, the number for low grade dysplasia

b. Of those who had RFA, the number for high grade dysplasia

c. Of those who had RFA, the number for intramucosal cancer

6. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett's oesophagus who had EMR followed by
radiofrequency ablation (RFA)
a. Of those who had RFA, the number for low grade dysplasia
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b. Of those who had RFA, the number for high grade dysplasia
c. Of those who had RFA, the number for intramucosal cancer

7. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett’'s oesophagus treated with photodynamic therapy
8. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett’'s oesophagus treated with cryotherapy

9. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett’'s oesophagus who had an antireflux operation
10. No. of patients diagnosed with Barrett’'s oesophagus who had an Oesophagectomy

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your
request to the individual GP practices within NHS South Sefton CCG.

A list of all GP practices can be found on our website http://www.southseftonccg.org.uk/
under, ABOUT US - WHO’'S WHO - MEMBER GP PRACTICES.

http://www.nhs.uk/Service-Search/GP/LocationSearch/4

11. Total no. of patients treated for oesophageal cancer
a. Adenocarcinoma
b. Squamous cell carcinoma
c. Other cancer types
The total number of patients treat for oesophageal cancer is 26

12. Total no. of patients treated for oesophageal cancer who had previously been
diagnosed with Barrett’'s oeosophagus

13. No. of patients with high grade dysplasia put back into surveillance without any other
treatment

14. Number of patients with HGD in surveillance who developed adenocarcinoma
15. No. of people with adenocarcinoma treated with endoscopic therapies

16. No. of people with stage T1A are treated with a) endoscopic therapies b) resection c)
other treatments

17. No. of people with stage T1B are treated with a) endoscopic therapies b) resection c)
other treatments

18. How many people with stage T2 are treated with a) endoscopic therapies b) resection
c) other treatments

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your
request to the individual GP practices within NHS South Sefton CCG.

A list of all GP practices can be found on our website http://www.southseftonccg.org.uk/
under, ABOUT US - WHO’S WHO - MEMBER GP PRACTICES.

http://www.nhs.uk/Service-Search/GP/LocationSearch/4
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