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Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
 
Request/Response: 

 
1. Of the £700 million (winter funding) announced by the Department of Health, how much 

was allocated to your CCG? 
 
NHS South Sefton CCG were allocated £1.213million as part of winter funding. An 
additional £0.103million was allocated for mental health winter resilience funding. 

 
2. How much of the money allocated to your CCG was spent directly on 

 
i. substantive medical staff 
ii. locum/overtime medical staff?  

 
NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. Therefore, we would suggest you 
redirect your enquiry to the Providers at the following addresses:- 
 
Mersey Care NHS Trust;  freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk 
 
Aintree University Hospital Foundation Trust; FOIrequests@aintree.nhs.uk  
 
Liverpool Community HealthTrust; FOI@LiverpoolCH.nhs.uk  

 
3. How much of the money allocated to your CCG was spent directly on  

 
i.   substantive nursing staff in the A&E department 
ii. locum/overtime nursing staff in the A&E department?  

 
NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. Therefore, we would suggest you 
redirect your enquiry to the Providers at the following addresses:- 

 
 
Aintree University Hospital Foundation Trust; FOIrequests@aintree.nhs.uk  

 

Our ref: FOI ID 4432 
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4. What other staff or schemes were funded by these monies?  

 

Please see below a list of schemes funded by Winter Resilience funding for South Sefton CCG 

 Resilience Tranche 1 

Sefton LA - Pre A&E Assessment, turnaround and discharge 

Go-to-doc / North West Ambulance Service pathfinder 

Warm Homes (Sefton Local Authority) 

Primary Care Capacity  

Public Awareness (Liverpool City Council) 

Out of Hours service (North West Ambulance Service) 

13 additional Intermediate Care beds in the community 

Enhanced Intermediate Care service to support admission avoidance / early discharge  

contribution to SRG (seasonal resilience group)   
 


