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Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Request/Response: 
 
            Please supply the following two / (three) figures for the CGG:  

1. The total CCG budget for the financial year 2014-2015.  
 
                NHS South Sefton CCG’s total budget for 2014 - 2015 - £231,342  

2. The total spent on Pathology services in the financial year 2014-2015 (PRIMARY CARE    
    ONLY).  
 
    NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this level of information.  You may wish to redirect 
    your request to Aintree University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust via the following link:  
    FOIrequests@aintree.nhs.uk  

3. If you are in a position to supply this - the total unit activity of Pathology services in the  
    financial year 2014-2015 (PRIMARY CARE ONLY). 
 
    NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this level of information.  You may wish to redirect 
    your request to Aintree University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust via the following link:  
    FOIrequests@aintree.nhs.uk  
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