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Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding
expenditure and referrals for child and adolescent mental health services within NHS South Sefton
CCG.

Request/Response:

1. Please can you provide an account of the amount of money spent on Child and Adolescent
Mental Health (CAMHS) services by your CCG in the following financial years;

a) 2010/11 - NA CCG'’s did not exist

b) 2011/12 - NA CCG'’s did not exist

c) 2012/13 - NA CCG’s did not exist

d) 2013/14 - £2,019,624

e) 2014/15 - £1,995,676

f) 2015/16 - Information not yet available

2. Please can you provide the amount spent by your CCG on Child and Adolescent Mental
Health services for eating disorders in the following financial years;

a) 2010/11 - Part of block payment for CAHMS
b) 2011/12 - Part of block payment for CAHMS
c) 2012/13 - Part of block payment for CAHMS
d) 2013/14 - Part of block payment for CAHMS
e) 2014/15 - Part of block payment for CAHMS
f) 2015/16 - Part of block payment for CAHMS

3. Please can you provide the number of referrals to Child and Adolescent Mental Health
services in your CCG area in and the number who received treatment for the following
years

a) 2010/11 - NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this data.
b) 2011/12 - NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this data.
c) 2012/13 - NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this data.
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d) 2013/14 - NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this data.
e) 2014/15 - NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this data.
f) 2015/16 - Information not yet available

Please contact Alder Hey Children’s Foundation Trust on the contact
details below who may hold this information

Info-gov@alderhey-nhs.uk
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