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4 May 2017

southseftonccg.foi@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request
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Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding hip / knee
replacement services within NHS South Sefton CCG.

Request/Response:

1. The number of elective (a) hip replacement and (b) knee replacement surgeries funded each
year in 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and 2016/17

South Sefton CCG 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16 2016/17

Hip 264 279 276 264
Knee 242 273 296 294
Grand Total 506 552 572 558

NB: 2016/2017 data refers to April 16 to February 17 (11 months).

The CCG may refer to previous FOI responses it has sent me if they cover the question 1 data for
2013/14-2015/16. 2016/17 data should be provided regardless.

2. The number of successful Individual Funding Requests (or equivalent procedure) made for (a)
hip replacement and (b) knee replacement surgeries each year in 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and
2016/17

2013/2014 2014/2015 2015/2016 2016/2017
a) 0 0 0 0
b) 0 0 0 1 request approved
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For NHS South Sefton CCG Prior Approval Team Authorisations:

November 2016
onwards*
a) 12 requests
b) 16 requests

*Requests for these treatments were required to come via the Prior Approval process from
November 2016 onwards for Treatments undertaken by Renacres and Southport and Ormskirk
NHS Trust.

3. The number of unsuccessful Individual Funding Requests (or equivalent procedure) made for (a)
hip replacement and (b) knee replacement surgeries each year in 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and
2016/17

Questions 1-3 cover both full and partial replacements within each category.

2013/2014 2014/2015 2015/2016 2016/2017
a) 0 0 0 0
b) 0 0 0 1 request declined

For NHS South Sefton CCG Prior Approval Team Authorisations:

November 2016
onwards*

a) 0

b) 1 request declined

*Requests for these treatments were required to come via the Prior Approval process from
November 2016 onwards for Treatments undertaken by Renacres and Southport and Ormskirk
NHS Trust.

4. The number of people recorded as having malnutrition (i.e undernutrition) each year by GP
practices in the area in 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and 2016/17 (if this is recorded by the CCG)

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information You may wish to redirect your query to
NHS England

england.contactus@nhs.net

5. The number of people prescribed Oral Nutritional Supplements each year in 2013/14, 2014/15,
2015/16 and 2016/17, broken down by gender

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. We do however hold information on the
number of items dispensed and by cost. If you would like this information please let us know.

6. Please provide a list of all GP practices in the CCG area and a contact email address for each
(to which FOI requests might be sent)
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Please see the link below

http://www.southseftonccg.nhs.uk/about-us/our-member-practices/



