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Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding the 
amount of referrals made to the M Clinic and the Aural Toilet clinic at the Royal Liverpool Hospital 
from practices within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. Amount of referrals made to the M Clinic and the  Aural Toilet clinic at the Royal from Sefton

Practices.

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to redirect your query to
the provider

The Royal Liverpool and Broadgreen University Hospitals NHS Trust
foi@rlbuht.nhs.uk

2. What the waiting time is and also the cost for some of the more common procedures?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to redirect your query to
NHS England

england.contactus@nhs.net

For information their website link is below

https://www.england.nhs.uk/commissioning/

3. Also how many referrals to ophthalmology for glaucoma patient’s intra ocular pressures

For 2016/2017 there were 6485 ophthalmology referrals. We are unable to break this down to
identify how many of these are for glaucoma patient’s intra ocular pressures only.
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4. Number of ENT out patient’s appointments and procedures

Appointments Only 
Outpatient 
Procedures 

3427 4697 

5. Ophthalmology out patient’s appointments

Appointments (incl 
Outpatient Procedures) 

21,564 


