NHS

South Sefton

Clinical Commissioning Group

Our Ref: FOI ID 37997 NHS South Sefton CCG
. Merton House

Stanley Road

22 June 2017 Bootle
Merseyside
southseftonccg.foi@nhs.net L20 3DL

Tel: 0151 247 7000
Email: southsefton.ccg@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding
Telehealth / Digital Health, Community Equipment Services and Wheelchair services within NHS
South Sefton CCG.

Request/Response:

1. Details of all current contracts you have, including the name, address and contact details
of the service provider;

Telehealth Provider: Immedicare LLP, Airedale General Hospital, Skipton Road, Steeton,
Keighley, West Yorkshire, BD20 6TD

Community Equipment Services: Mersey Care NHS FT, V7 Kings Business Park, Prescot,
Liverpool, L34 1PJ . Contact: Wilma Taylor, Head of Contracts.
Wilma.taylor@merseycare.nhs.uk

Wheelchair Services: NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. This service is
commissioned by NHS England. You may wish to redirect your query to NHS England

england.contactus@nhs.net

2. The renewal date of the contracts;
Telehealth: 31/03/2018
Community Equipment Services: 31/05/2021
Wheelchair Services: Not applicable

3. Start date of the contracts;
Telehealth: 01/04/2017

Community Equipment Services: 01/06/2017
Wheelchair Services: Not applicable

Chair: Dr Andrew Mimnagh
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor
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Value of contracts;

Telehealth £146,085

Community Equipment Services: The Community Equipment Services is a service provided as
part of the Community Services Contract.

Wheelchair Services: Not applicable

Spend on Telehealth/Digital Health for previous financial year 2016--17;

£146,085

Spend on community equipment for previous financial year 2016--17;

£587,644
Spend on wheelchair services for previous financial year 2016--17;
Not applicable

Number of citizens receiving a telecare service funded by the local authority;

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to redirect your query to
Sefton Council

information@sefton.gov.uk

Commissioning officer name/s, email address/es and phone number/s.

Moira Harrison, Planned Care Lead
Moria.harrison@southportandformbyccg.nhs.uk
0151 247 7000

Jan Leonard, Chief Commissioning and Redesign Officer
Jan.leonard@southseftonccg.nhs.uk
0151 247 7000
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