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South Sefton

Clinical Commissioning Group

Our Ref: FOI ID 39201 NHS South Sefton CCG
. Merton House

Stanley Road

3 August 2017 Bootle
Merseyside

southseftonccg.foi@nhs.net L20 3DL

Tel: 0151 247 7000
Email: southsefton.ccg@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding
Wheelchair and Community services within NHS South Sefton CCG.

Request/Response:

Wheelchair Service

PN

Which geographical area(s) does the service cover?
Does the service provide for Adults and Children?
What population size does the service cover?
Which organisation provides your clinical assessments

a. What is the annual value of the contract?

b. What are the start and end dates of the contract including any permitted extension
Which organisation provides you're Approved Repairer services

a. What is the annual value of the contract?

b. What are the start and end dates of the contract including any permitted extension?
What are the contact details of the Commissioner(s) responsible for the service?

N/A — This service is not commissioned by NHS South Sefton CCG, please redirect your
query NHS England who commission the service. england.contactus@nhs.net

Integrated Community Equipment Service (ICES)
In the event that your ICES contract is managed by a Council organisation, please provide the
contact details of the person/Dept. responsible for answering FOI requests.

1.

Which geographical area(s) does the service cover?

All patients registered with a South Sefton GP and any resident of South Sefton, who may
not be registered with a South Sefton GP.

Does the service provide for Adults and Children?

Yes

Chair: Dr Andrew Mimnagh
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor
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3. What population size does the service cover?
154,859
4. Which organisation provides your clinical assessments
Mersey Care NHS Trust
a. What is the annual value of the contract?
£588,000 — Community equipment element only
b. What are the start and end dates of the contract including any permitted extension
1st June 2017 — 30th May 2022
5. Which organisation provides you’re Approved Repairer services

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, please redirect your query to
Mersey Care NHS Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

a. What is the annual value of the contract?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, please redirect your query to
Mersey Care NHS Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

b. What are the start and end dates of the contract including any permitted extension?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, please redirect your query to
Mersey Care NHS Trust freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

6. What are the contact details of the Commissioner(s) responsible for the service?

David Warwick — Unplanned Care Lead David.warwick@southseftonccg.nhs.uk
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