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Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding heart 
failure with the treatment of Furosemide within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1) Number of inpatients with heart failure in the last 5 years, with heart failure being any part of the
diagnosis 

Commissioner 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 

South Sefton CCG 936 1093 1342 1922 

2) Number of inpatients with heart failure in the last 5 years, with heart failure being the primary
diagnosis 

Commissioner 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 

South Sefton CCG 191 242 371 885 

3) Number of inpatients, regardless of condition, were treated with Furosemide (tablets or
intravenous injection) in the last 5 years 

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; please redirect your query to – 

Aintree University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
FOI.requests@aintree.nhs.uk 

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
FOIRequests@lhch.nhs.uk 

The Royal Liverpool and Broadgreen University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
foi@rlbuht.nhs.uk 
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4) Number of inpatients that were treated with Furosemide in the last 5 years had heart failure as
any part of the diagnosis 

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; please redirect your query to – 

Aintree University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
FOI.requests@aintree.nhs.uk 

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
FOIRequests@lhch.nhs.uk 

The Royal Liverpool and Broadgreen University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
foi@rlbuht.nhs.uk 

5) Number of inpatients that were treated with Furosemide in the last 5 years had heart failure as
the primary diagnosis 

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; please redirect your query to – 

Aintree University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
FOI.requests@aintree.nhs.uk 

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
FOIRequests@lhch.nhs.uk 

The Royal Liverpool and Broadgreen University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
foi@rlbuht.nhs.uk 




