
Chair: Dr Andrew Mimnagh 
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor 

NHS South Sefton CCG 

Merton House 
Stanley Road 

Bootle 
Merseyside 

L20 3DL 

Tel: 0151 247 7000 

Email: southsefton.ccg@nhs.net 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding GP 
Federations within South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. Name of the Federation

South Sefton Primary Healthcare

2. Number and list of names of practices

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to forward your query
to South Sefton Primary Healthcare. south.seftonpch@nhs.net

3. Structure of each Federation (whether a LTD company, LLP, coop, CIC etc.)

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to forward your query
to South Sefton Primary Healthcare. south.seftonpch@nhs.net

4. Main point of contact for each Federation

Dr Martin Vickers

5. Population covered

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to forward your query
to South Sefton Primary Healthcare. south.seftonpch@nhs.net
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